
Grinnell FINANCE COMMITTEE Meeting 
MONDAY, SEPTEMBER 21, 2020 AT 8:00 A.M. 

VIA ZOOM 
 

Join Zoom Meeting 
https://zoom.us/j/95084878088?pwd=TGo2Q3c2ME5UYXlEU0ZwUGsvbUFvdz09 
 
Meeting ID: 950 8487 8088 
Passcode: 500430 
One tap mobile 
+13126266799,,95084878088#,,,,,,0#,,500430# US (Chicago)  
+19292056099,,95084878088#,,,,,,0#,,500430# US (New York) 
 
Dial by your location 
        +1 312 626 6799 US (Chicago) 
        +1 929 205 6099 US (New York) 
        +1 301 715 8592 US (Germantown) 
        +1 346 248 7799 US (Houston) 
        +1 669 900 6833 US (San Jose) 
        +1 253 215 8782 US (Tacoma) 
Meeting ID: 950 8487 8088 
Passcode: 500430 
Find your local number: https://zoom.us/u/ab2diSd9yn 
 
TENTATIVE AGENDA 
ROLL CALL:  Wray (Chair), White, Bly.   
 
PERFECTING AND APPROVAL OF AGENDA:   
 
COMMITTEE BUSINESS: 
 

1. Consider approval of resolution authorizing payment in the amount of 
$33,799.74 for payment of Iowa Reinvestment Grant funds for the 
improvements made by Grinnell Center, LLC in accordance with development 
agreement (See Resolution No. 2020-155). 

2. Consider resolution accepting the Street Finance Report for FY 2020 (See 
Resolution No. 2020-156). 

3. Consider special Campbell Fund request to contribute to a new local youth 
mentoring program. 

4. Update on economic development projects. 
 
INQUIRIES:   
 
ADJOURN:  
 
 

https://zoom.us/j/95084878088?pwd=TGo2Q3c2ME5UYXlEU0ZwUGsvbUFvdz09
https://zoom.us/u/ab2diSd9yn


RESOLUTION NO. 2020-155 
 
 
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING PAYMENT IN THE AMOUNT OF $33,799.74 
FOR PAYMENT OF IOWA REINVESTMENT GRANT FUNDS FOR THE 
IMPROVEMENTS MADE BY GRINNELL CENTER, LLC IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT  
 
 

WHEREAS, the City of Grinnell is committed to the promotion of 
economic development opportunities; and 
 

WHEREAS, Grinnell Center, LLC has made enhancements to the 
property known as Hotel Grinnell located at 925 Park Street per the development 
agreement; and 
 

WHEREAS, City Council did approve the development agreement with 
Grinnell Center, LLC on the 6th day of September, 2016 by resolution; and  

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Grinnell City Council 

meeting in regular session this 21st day of September, 2020, that the City Clerk 
is hereby authorized and directed to make the payment in the amount of 
$33,799.74 for improvements made to Grinnell Center, LLC. 

 
Passed and adopted this 31st day of September, 2020. 
 
 
 
_____________________________ 
Dan F. Agnew, Mayor  
 
 
 
Attest:  
 
 
 
________________________________   
Annmarie Wingerter, City Clerk/Finance Director 



RESOLUTION NO. 2020-156 
 
A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING AND APPROVING THE STREET FINANCE 
REPORT FOR FY 2018 
 
WHEREAS, the City of Grinnell, Iowa has prepared the 2020 Annual Street 
Finance Report detailing revenues and expenditures for the fiscal year July 1, 
2019 to June 30, 2020; and 
 
WHEREAS, it has been approved by the City Council. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of Grinnell, Iowa 
that the proposed Street Finance Report for the fiscal year ending June 30, 2020 
is hereby approved and adopted and the City Clerk is hereby authorized and 
directed to file the adopted report with the Transportation Planner of the Iowa 
Department of Transportation. 
 
WHEREUPON, Mayor Agnew declared Resolution duly passed and approved 
this 21st day of September 2020. 
 

 
 

______________________________________ 
    DAN F. AGNEW, MAYOR 
 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
______________________________________   
ANNMARIE WINGERTER, CITY CLERK/FINANCE DIRECTOR 
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To: Grinnell City Council 

From: Sharon Mealey, Administrative Assistant 

In February the city council approved our usual donation to Big Brothers Big Sisters Bowl for 
Kids’ Sake event. The donation was for two teams at $300 per team. Due to the pandemic the 
event scheduled for April was cancelled. In August I was contacted by Francesca Cunningham. 
She explained that the local chapter of Big Brothers Big Sisters was disbanded. The board 
decided to go out on their own with a local mentoring program much like the Big Brothers Big 
Sisters program. By no longer being under the umbrella of the Big Brothers Big Sisters program 
the funds raised by the Grinnell board will stay local.  

Attached is a follow up email from Francesca Cunningham. The local board requested the 
Campbell Trust request a refund of our donation and consideration of donating the same 
amount to their new local mentoring program.  Our trustee, Roger Roland, obtained the refund 
(documentation attached). It will be up to the council to decide if $600 will be donated to the 
new local program at this time. 

 

 



1

Sharon Mealey

From: Francesca Cunningham <bbbsfrancesca@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2020 4:00 PM
To: Sharon Mealey
Subject: Bowling refund from Big Brothers Big Sisters

Hi Sharon,  
 
It was good to talk to you earlier this week! I'm glad I had the chance to explain that mentoring WILL continue 
in Grinnell this year and hopefully, we WILL have a bowling fundraiser in the Spring....we have simply made a 
decision as a board to become a local program with the goal to keep more money in the community allowing us 
to serve Grinnell kids in the very best way possible. 
 
I know you mentioned that it may not be possible for the John Campbell Fund/City of Grinnell to accept a 
donation refund for the cancelled Bowl For Kids' Sake event. If you decide that it is possible, here is the info 
you'll need to get your refund: 
 
1. Please call and speak to Lynne Carroll, director of Heart of Iowa Big Brothers Big Sisters @ 641-753-6370. 
     I would simply say, "I received your letter stating that the Grinnell Bowl For Kids' Sake will not be 
rescheduled so we are requesting that our $600 Strike Sponsorship for 2 teams be refunded."  Then supply her 
with your mailing address. 
 
I apologize ahead of time if she does not exude warm fuzzies towards you! :( 
 
2. If you do receive a refund and decide you'd like that money to go towards our new mentoring program, please
direct your donation to LINK and clearly state "mentoring program" in the memo line. The check can be mailed 
to: LINK Box 284, Grinnell, 50112. The new program will retain the same community board, the same mentor 
coordinators, and the same dedication to safety as in the past. 
 
Regardless of what you decide to do, please know that we continue to be grateful for your support of kids and 
the power of mentoring over the years! We hope to continue this partnership into the future. 
 
If you have any questions, please let me know!! Take care and be safe. 
 
Francesca Cunningham 
641-990-0567 
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